COMPANIES (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE 2009

Arrangement of Sections

SECTION
1. Short title and commencement
2. Amendment of section 30 (2) of the Companies Ordinance
3. Amendment of section 40 of the principal Ordinance
4. Amendment of section 198A (3) of the principal Ordinance
5. Amendment of section 208 (1)(d) of the principal Ordinance



Cap. 122

Short title and
commencement

Amendment of
section 30 (2) of
the Companies
Ordinance

Amendment of
section 40 of the
pringipal
Ordinance

Amendment of
section 198A (3)
of the principal
Ordinance

Amendment of
section 208(1)(d)
of the principal
Ordinance

TURKS AND CAICOS ISLANDS
COMPANIES (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE 2009

(Ordinance 15 of 2009)

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE COMPANIES ORDINANCE AND FOR
CONNECTED PURPOSES.

ENACTED by the Acting Governor of the Turks and Caicos
Islands.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Companies
(Amendment) Ordinance 2009 and shall come into force on 1%
January 2010.

2. Section 30 (2) of the Companies Ordinance (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Ordinance”) is amended by deleting
“$50” and substituting “$100”.

3. Section 40 of the principal Ordinance is amended by
deleting the words “$50 for every day during which such default
continues” and substituting “$350”.

4. Section 198A (3) of the principal Ordinance is amended by
deleting “$100” and substituting “$200”.

S. Section 208 (1)(d) of the principal Ordinance is amended by
deleting “$250” and substituting “$300”.

Dated this 8" day of December 2009.

MARK CAPES
ACTING GOVERNOR



